®

ORDINANCE NO. 1962

Revised by Bill No. 1627 (12/7/99)

Uniform Fire Code

"AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF HENDERSON REPEALING
CHAPTER 15.32 "FIRE CODE," OF THE HENDERSON
MUNICIPAL CODE IN ITS ENTIRETY AND ADOPTING A NEW
CHAPTER 15.32 TO THE HENDERSON MUNICIPAL CODE
ENTITLED “UNIFORM FIRE CODE,” AND OTHER MATTERS
RELATED THERETO.

NOW, THERFORE, the City Council does ordain as follows:

SECTION 1. Henderson Municipal Code Chapter 15.32 entilted "Fire Code” is hereby repealed
in its entirety.

SECTION 2. Pursuant to the provisions of the Henderson City Charter Section 2.160(3), the
Uniform Fire Code 1997 Edition as amended herein and with certain appendixes
is hereby adopted by reference with said amendments and other matters related

thereto set forth as follows:

15.32.010 SHORT TITLE.

This Chapter shall be known as the City of Henderson "Fire Code" and may be cited as
such.

Where the designation "Uniform Fire Code" or the abbreviation "UFC" appears in this
ordinance, it shall be construed as referring to the 1997 Uniform Fire Code as adopted by

this Ordinance.



CITY OF HENDERSON

ORDINANCE NO. 1962 PAGE 2

15.32.020 ADOPTION. (‘}

The City of Henderson adopts as its Fire Code the "Uniform Fire Code, 1997 Edition",

Volume I and Volume II, as published by the International Fire Code Imstitute, 5360
Workman Mill Road, Whittier, California 90601, including the following appendices: I-C
Stairway Identification; II-A, Suppression and Control of Hazardous Fire Areas; II-B, C
Protection of Flammable and Combustible Liquid Tanks in Locations Subject to Flooding; I- ‘
C, Marinas; II-D, Rifle Ranges; II-E, Hazardous Materials Management Plans and
Hazardous Materials Inventory Statements; II-F, Protected Aboveground Tanks for Motor

Vehicle Fuel-dispensing Stations Outside Buildings; II-G, Secondary Containment for
Underground Tank Systems Containing Flammable or Combustible Liquids; II-H, Site O
Assessments for Determining Potential Fire and Explosion Risks from Underground
Flammable or Combustible Liquid Tank Leaks; II-I, Ozone Gas-generating Equipment; II-J,

Storage of Flammable and Combustible Liquids in Tanks Located within Below-grade

Vaults; III-A, Fire-flow Requirements for Buildings; III-B, Fire Hydrant Locations and
Distribution; VI-A, Hazardous Materials Classifications, VI-B, Hazard Ranking; VI-C,
Emergency Relief Venting for Fire Exposure for Aboveground Tanks; and VI-F,
Recommended Separation Distances for Explosive Materials is hereby designated as the City

of Henderson Fire Code and by this designation and reference is hereby adopted and made a

part of this chapter, the same as if it were fully set forth herein. One copy of this Fire Code

is on file in the Office of the City Clerk.

Chapter 15.32 Uniform Fire Code C
15.32.010 Short Title.
15.32.020 Adoption.
15.32.030 Code Amended.
15.32.040 Amendments to the 1997 Southern Nevada Fire Code Amendments.
(Revised 12/7/99)
15.32.050 Amendments to the 1997 Uniform Fire Code. (Revised 12/7/99)

15.32.060 Enforcement Authority.
15.32.070 State Fire Marshal’s Regulations.
15.32.080 Citations. _
15.32.090 Appeals and Relief from Regulations. C‘
15.32.100 Penalties.
15.32.110 Permit and Service Fee Schedule (Revised 12/7/99)

15.32.030 CODE AMENDED.

The City of Henderson also adopts the booklet entitled “1997 Southern Nevada Fire Code
Amendments” endorsed by the Southern Nevada Fire Chiefs Association, by the Southern
Nevada Fire Prevention Association and by the Southern Nevada Fire Code Committee. This
booklet is adopted in its entirety, excepting amendments and changes as stated in this

chapter. One copy of this Amendment Booklet is on file in the Office of the City Clerk. Q



«

€

(€

CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962 PAGE 3

15.32.040 AMENDMENTS TO THE 1997 SOUTHERN NEVADA FIRE CODE
AMENDMENTS.

Certain parts, articles, divisions, sections and subsections of the 1997 Edition of the Uniform
Fire Code are hereby supplemented, modified, amended and deleted as follows:

See supplemental document whereas the Southern Nevada Fire Code Amendments were
revised by Bill No. 1627 (12/7/99).

15.32.050 AMENDMENTS TO THE 1997 UNIFORM FIRE CODE.

Certain parts, articles, divisions, sections and subsections of the 1997 Edition of the Uniform
Fire Code are hereby supplemented, modified, amended and deleted as follows:

See supplemental document whereas the 1997 Fire Code Amendments were revised by Bill
No. 1627 (12/7/99).

15.32.060 ENFORCEMENT AUTHORITY.

The City of Henderson Fire Code shall be enforced by the Fire Prevention Bureau of the
Henderson Fire Department, which shall be operated under the supervision of the Chief of
the Fire Department.

15.32.070 STATE FIRE MARSHAL'S REGULATIONS.

Pursuant to NAC 477.280, the Fire Prevention Bureau of the Henderson Fire Department,
which is established under the supervision of the Chief of the Fire Department shall enforce
the regulations adopted by the State Fire Marshal.

15.32.080 CITATIONS.

The Chief of the Henderson Fire Department and members of the Fire Prevention Bureau
may prepare, sign and serve written citations on persons accused of violating any provision
of this title. Any designated employee issuing a citation pursuant to this section shall comply
with the provisions of NRS 171.1773.



CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962 PAGE 4

15.32.090 APPEALS AND RELIEF FROM REGULATIONS.

All decisions made by the Chief of the Fire Department under any discretionary authority
granted to him by Sections 2.28.040 of the Henderson Municipal Code; or any discretionary
Section contained in the Uniform Fire Code; or any local amendment to the Uniform Fire
Code are subject to review by the City Council. Presentation of a written protest by an
affected party must be made to the Chief's Office with a copy filed with the City Clerk
within thirty days from the date of the action protested.

Any person desiring relief from any of the provisions adopted by the Nevada State Fire
Marshal Division must appeal same in accordance with NRS 477.285. Written approval from
the State Fire Marshal's Office for relief from regulations adopted by the State shall be
required prior to any appeal to the City Council for relief in regulations contained in this
Ordinance which are also contained in the State Fire Marshal's Regulations.

15.32.100 PENALTIES.

(@) Any person who violates any of the provisions of the Code or Standards hereby adopted

or fail to comply therewith, or who violates or fails to comply with any order made
thereunder, or who builds in violation of any detailed statement of specifications or plans
submitted and approved thereunder, or any certificate or permit issued thereunder, and from -
which no appeal has been taken, or who fails to comply with such an order as affirmed or C'
modified by the Chief, Fire Prevention Division, City Council or State Fire Marshal or by a

court of jurisdiction, within the time fixed herein, shall severally for each and every such
violation and noncompliance, respectively, be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine

of not more than $1,000 or by imprisonment for not more than six months or by both such

fine and imprisonment. The imposition of one penalty for any violation shall not excuse the
violation or permit it to continue; and all such persons shall be required to correct or remedy

such violations or defects within a reasonable time; and when not otherwise specified, each

day that prohibited conditions are maintained shall constitute a separate offense.

(b) The application of the above penalty shall not be held to prevent the enforced removal of
prohibited conditions. C

15.32.110 FIRE DEPARTMENT PERMIT FEES.

An Ordinance of the City Council of the City of Henderson, Nevada amending Chapter 15.32 of

the Henderson Municipal Code as it relates to Fire Department Permit and Service Fee C
Schedules, Setting February 01, 2000 as the effective date was adopted by Bill No. 1627 on
December 07, 1999.

See supplemental document whereas the Southern Nevada Fire Code Amendments were X
revised by Bill No. 1627 (12/7/99). C




«

€

CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962 PAGE 5

SECTION 3. REPEAL OF CONFLICTING ORDINANCES All ordinances, or parts of
ordinances, sections, subsection, phrases, sentences, clauses or paragraphs
contained in the Municipal Code of the City of Henderson, Nevada, in conflict
herewith are repealed.

SECTION 4. VALIDITY. The City Council of the City of Henderson, Nevada hereby
declares that should any section, paragraph, sentence or word of this ordinance or
of the Code or Standards hereby adopted be declared for any reason to be invalid,
it is the intent of The City Council of the City of Henderson, Nevada that it would
have passed all other portions of this ordinance independent of the elimination
therefrom of any such portion as may be declared invalid.

SECTION 5. DATE OF EFFECT. A copy of this Ordinance shall be filed with the office of
the City Clerk, and notice of such filing shall be published once by title in the Henderson Home
News, a newspaper having general circulation in the City of Henderson, at least one (1) week
prior to the adoption of said Ordinance, and following approval shall be published by title (or in
full if the Council by majority vote so orders) together with the names of the Councilmen voting
for or against passage for at least one (1) publication before the Ordinance shall become
effective.

ORDINANCE NO. 1962
UNIFORM FIRE CODE

Was PASSED and ADOPTED on the 7" day of December, 1999.

JAMES GIBSON, MAYOR

ATTEST:

MONICA M. SIMMONS
CITY CLERK

The above and foregoing Ordinance was first proposed and read in title to the City Council on
November 9, 1999, which was a Regular Meeting and referred to a Committee of the following
Council Members:

"COUNCIL AS A WHOLE"

Thereafter, said Committee reported favorably on the Ordinance on December 7, 1999, which
was a Regular Meeting of the Henderson City Council, at which time the Ordinance was read in
title and adopted by roll call vote.



| CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962 : PAGE 1

| O 15.32.050 AMENDMENTS TO THE 1997 UNIFORM FIRE CODE.

Certain parts, articles, divisions, sections and subsections of the 1997 Edition of the Uniform
Fire Code are hereby supplemented, modified, amended and deleted as follows:

1. Section 101.6 "Conflicting Provisions", is amended by numbering the existing text as sub-
section 1. and adding a new Sub-section 101.6.2 as follows;

Conflicting Provisions

101.6.2 If conflicts exist between any provision of this Ordinance and any provision of the
Uniform Fire Code, 1997 Edition, or any other Code, Ordinance, or law adopted by the City
of Henderson, the more stringent requirement providing the greatest safety from fire and for
life shall prevail.

The trade-off provisions granted in the Hillside Ordinance for fire department access roads
and water supplies for fire protection are still applicable. The requirement that all
buildings are provided with an approved fire sprinkler system is a more stringent
requirement, thus the Hillside Ordinance # 1752, dated July 1, 1997, would take precedence.

2. Section 902.2.1 “Required Access”, 2™ paragraph, is amended by adding a second
sentence as follows;

902.2.1 Required Access. ...Approved secondary access shall be provided for 20 or more
dwelling units, road(s) with dead-ends or with single-point access in excess of 600 feet, and
for commercial developments.

3. A new Section 902.2.4.3 is added as follows:

902.2.4.3 Speed Bumps and Speed Humps. Speed bumps and/or speed humps shall not be
permitted within the required width of fire apparatus access roads.

Exception: Speed humps are allowed when approved by the Fire Department. The
location(s) and the design of the speed hump(s) shall meet the approval of the Fire
Prevention Division.

4. Section 1003.2.6.1 is revised by including Group H, Division 5 Occupancies as follows:

1003.2.6.1 General. An automatic fire-extinguishing system shall be installed in Group H,
Division 1, 2, 3, 5, and 7 Occupancies.




CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962 PAGE 2

Section 1006.2.5 is amended by adding a new sentence at the end of the first paragraph as
follows:

1006.2.5 Special Provisions for Automatic Sprinkler Systems. ... A valve which controls
the water supply for commercial-type cooking suppression systems shall be provided and
arranged to automatically shut off the fuel supply to the cooking equipment and all electrical
receptacles which are located under the hood, when the valve for the water supply is shut off.

Section 7701.7.1 is revised as follows:

7701.7.1 Manufacturing of Explosives. Explosive materials for wholesale and/or retail sale
shall not be manufactured within the City of Henderson.

Section 7701.7.2 is revised as follows:

7701.7.2 Storage of Explosives. Explosive materials shall be stored only in areas zoned and
approved for such use and shall be subject to approval by the Fire Prevention Bureau.

Section 7902.2.2.1 is revised as follows:

7902.2.2.1. Locations Where Aboveground Tanks Are Prohibited. Storage of Class I and
II liquids in aboveground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited within the City of
Henderson.

EXCEPTION: 1. Areas zoned industrial and subject to approval of the Chief.

2. "Protected Tanks" in accordance with the provisions of Appendix II-F.

3. Aboveground generator storage tanks which are installed in accordance with the
Southern Nevada Fire Prevention Association’s Approved Guidelines.

¢

),



CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962 PAGE 3

15.32.040 AMENDMENTS TO THE 1997 SOUTHERN NEVADA FIRE CODE
AMENDMENTS.

1. Item No. 2, Page 1, which amended Section 103.3.5 Fees is deleted in its entirety.

2. Item No. 3, Page 2, which amended Section 103.3.6 Service Charges for Special
Occurrences is deleted in its entirety.

3. Item Number 12, Page 7, is amended as follows:

12.  Section 902.2.2.1 Fire Apparatus Access Roads, Dimensions: is revised as
follows:

902.2.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed
width of not less than 24 feet provided no parking is allowed, not less than 32
feet if parallel parking is allowed on one side, and not less than 40 if parallel
parking is allowed on both sides. Vertical clearance shall be not less than 13
feet 6 inches.

EXCEPTION: 1. For Group R, Division 3 residential subdivisions, the
minimum width of a fire apparatus access road is 36 feet measured face of curb
to face of curb (i.e., 20 feet driving lane with 8 feet of parking on each side).
2. When approved by the Chief, vertical clearance may be reduced, provided
such reduction does not impair access by fire apparatus and approved signs are
installed and maintained, indicating the established vertical clearance.

Vertical clearances or widths shall be increased when, in the opinion of the Chief,
vertical clearances or widths are not adequate to provide fire apparatus access.

4. Item No. 33, Page 14, which amended Section 1007.2.3 is deleted.

5. Item Number 78, Appendix 1li-B Fire Hydrants and Distribution, Section 3, Sub-section
Number 6, Page 32 is amended as follows:

6. The required fire flow and spacing requirements for fire hydrants are both utilized
to determine the number of fire hydrants to be installed, based on a maximum of
1,000 gallons per minute per fire hydrant.




CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962 PAGE 4

15.32.110 PERMIT AND SERVICE FEE SCHEDULE

The purpose of this Permit and Service Fee Schedule (Schedule) is to establish fees for specific
permits identified in the Uniform Fire Code (UFC), as adopted by the City of Henderson, and
to establish fees for services performed by the Fire Department. All terms not defined in this
Schedule have the meanings set forth in the UFC, as adopted by the City.

There are various types of fees set forth in this Fee Schedule. Except as otherwise provided,
each type of fee is separate and independent of the others, and each fee must be paid in
advance. Failure to pay a fee by the time or within the period specified is sufficient grounds to
withhold a permit, inspection, or certificate of occupancy, or to void a permit previously
issued. In addition, the failure to obtain a permit or renew a permit in a timely manner may
result in the doubling of the fee amount. Items which are asterisked indicate activities of a type
which, depending on the activity, are subject to fees under more than one fee category.

The initial permit fee for a permit and the subsequent fee for renewal of a permit includes, and
is intended to offset the cost of, initial inspection and plan review required in connection with
the issuance of a permit or renewal, up to the first hour of such services. Additional
inspections or inspection work, plan review work, code research work, re-inspections, or
inspections requested for a time outside of normal business hours will be charged a fee in
accordance with Section VI below. Such additional fees are payable in advance based upon the
estimated time required to conduct the inspection. Fees for inspections or other services that
have not been paid in advance must be paid immediately upon notice thereof.

Nothing in this Permit and Service Fee Schedule is intended, nor shall it be used, to determine
the minimum number of overtime hours nor the hourly wage for employees.

Federal, State, and local government entities, including the Clark County School District, are
exempt from the payment of permit fees and plan check fees.

Permit and Service Fees

A fee in accordance with this Schedule shall be paid to the City of Henderson, at the time of
application for a permit and/or plan review for all of the following:

A renewable permit required by 97 UFC § 105.8

An activity permit required by 97 UFC § 105.8

Permit for the installation, removal, or alteration required by 97 UFC
§105.8 as amended.

A hazardous materials storage permit required by 97 UFC §105.8

Water main/fire hydrant systems

Fire lane plans

Commercial new construction

A request for records, photographs, or documents

Other identified services

el

eRXIANR



CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962 PAGE 5

10.  Technology Fee
11.  Records Management Fee

Plan review fees are not refundable for plans already reviewed. A permit fee is not refundable
after an on-site inspection has been conducted and an applicant fails to qualify for a permit due
to deficiencies or violations of the Code.

1. FEES FOR RENEWABLE PERMITS

The following renewable permits within the categories set forth in UFC Section 105.8
are subject to a permit fee of $60 each:

Aerosol products (a.1)
To store or handle an aggregate quantity of Level 2 or Level 3 aerosol products in
excess of 500 pounds (226.8 kg) net weight. See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 88.

Aircraft refueling vehicles (a.2)
To operate aircraft refueling vehicles. See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 24.

Aircraft repair hanger (a.3)
To use any structure as an aircraft hangar for the purpose of servicing or repairing
aircraft. See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 24.

Automobile wrecking yard (a.5)
To operate an automobile wrecking yard. See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 34.

Battery system (b.1)
To operate stationary lead-acid battery systems having a liquid capacity of more than
100 gallons (378.5 L). See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 64.

Candles and open flames in assembly areas (c.1)

To use open flames or candles in connection with assembly areas, dining areas of
restaurants or drinking establishments. For definition of ASSEMBLY, see Article 2. See UFC
Section 105.8 and Article 25 for open flame and candles.

Cellulose nitrate film (c.3)
To store, handle, use, or display cellulose nitrate film. See UFC Section 105.8 and
Article 33.

Cellulose nitrate storage (c.4)

To store or handle more than 25 pounds (11.3 kg) of cellulose nitrate plastic
(pyroxylin) for the manufacturing or assembly of articles or parts of articles containing
cellulose nitrate plastics (pyroxylin). See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 27.

),

)
)



CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962 PAGE 6

Cellulose fiber storage (c.5)
To store or handle combustible fibers in quantities in excess of 100 cubic feet (2.83
m’). See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 28.

Combustible material storage (c.6)

To store more than 2,500 cubic feet (70.8 m’) gross volume of combustible empty
packing cases, boxes, barrels, or similar containers, or rubber or cork, or other similarly
combustible material. See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 11.

Commercial rubbish-handling operation (c.8)
To operate a commercial rubbish-handling operation. See UFC Section 105.8 and
Article 11.

Compressed gases (c.7)

To store, use, or handle at normal temperatures and pressures compressed gases in
excess of the amounts listed in Table 105-A. When the compressed gases in use or storage
exceed the amounts listed in Table 105-A, a permit is required to install, repair, abandon,
remove, place temporarily out of service, close, or substantially modify a compressed gas
system.

Exceptions:
1. Routine maintenance.
2. For emergency repair work performed on an emergency basis,

application for permit shall be made within two (2) working days of
commencement of work.

The permit applicant shall apply for approval to close storage, use, or handling
facilities at least 30 days prior to the termination of the storage, use, or handling of
compressed or liquefied gases.

Such application shall include any change or alteration of the facility closure plan filed
pursuant to Section 8001.13. This 30-day period may be waived by the Chief if there are
special circumstances requiring such waiver.

Cryogens (c.9)
Except where federal or state regulations apply and except for fuel systems of the
vehicle, to produce, store, or handle cryogens in excess of the amounts listed in Table 105-B.

Dry cleaning plants (d.1)

To engage in the business of dry cleaning or to change to a more hazardous cleaning
solvent. Such permits shall prescribe the class of system to be used. See UFC Section 105.8
and Article 36.



CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962 PAGE 7

Dust-producing operations (d.2)

To operate a grain elevator, flour starch mill, feed mill, or plant pulverizing aluminum,
coal, cocoa, magnesium, spices, or sugar, or other operation producing combustible dusts as
defined in Article 2. See UFC Section 105.8 and Articles 30 and 76.

Explosives or blasting agents, use or transportation (e.1)
For permits for explosives or blasting agents, see UFC Section 105.8 and Article 77.

Fireworks; manufacture, compound, store, sale (f.2)
For permits for fireworks, see UFC Section 105.8 and Article 78.

Flammable or combustible liquids; pipelines, store, handle, use (f.3)
See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 79.

1.

2.

To use or operate, repair, or modify a pipeline for the transportation of
flammable or combustible liquids.

To store, handle, or use Class I liquids in excess of 5 gallons (18.9 L) in a
building or in excess of 10 gallons (37.9 L) outside of a building, except that a
permit is not required for the following:

2.1  The storage or use of Class I liquids in the fuel tank of a motor vehicle,
aircraft, motorboat, mobile power plant, or mobile heating plant, unless
such storage, in the opinion of the Chief, would cause an unsafe
condition.

2.2  The storage or use of paints, oils, varnishes, or similar flammable
mixtures when such liquids are stored for maintenance, painting or
similar purposes for a period of not more than 30 days.

To store, handle, or use Class II or Class ITI-A liquids in excess of 25 gallons

(94.6 L) in a building or in excess of 60 gallons (227.1 L) outside a building,

except for fuel oil used in connection with oil-burning equipment.

To remove Class I or Class II liquids from an underground storage tank used

for fueling motor vehicles by any means other than the approved, stationary on-

site pumps normally used for dispensing purposes.

To operate tank vehicles, equipment, tanks, plants, terminals, wells, fuel-

dispensing stations, refineries, distilleries, and similar facilities where

flammable and combustible liquids are produced, processed, transported,
stored, dispensed, or used.

To abandon, place temporarily out of service, or otherwise dispose of a

flammable or combustible liquid tank.

To change the type of contents stored in a flammable or combustible liquid tank

to a material other than that for which the tank was designed and constructed.

Fruit ripening (f.4)
To operate a fruit-ripening process regulated by UFC Section 105.8 and Article 46.




CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962 PAGE 8

Fumigation or thermal insecticidal fogging (f.5)

To operate a business of fumigation or thermal insecticidal fogging and to maintain a
room, vault, or chamber in which a toxic or flammable fumigant is used. See UFC Section
105.8 and Article 47.

Hazardous materials; store, transport on site, dispense, use, handle (h.1)

To store, transport on site, dispense, use, or handle hazardous materials in excess of
the amounts listed in Table 105-C or to abandon or place temporarily out of service, a storage
facility or other area regulated by UFC Section 105.8 and Article 80 when the hazardous
materials in use or storage exceed the amounts listed in Table 105-C.

Hot-works operations (h.3)
Permits are required for hot work including, but not limited to:

1. Use of portable hot-work equipment inside a structure.
Exception: Work that is conducted under a construction permit issued
by the building official.

2. Fixed-site hot-work equipment such as welding booths.

3. Hot work conducted within a Hazardous Fire Area.

High-piled combustible storage (h.2)

To use any building or portion thereof as a high-piled storage area exceeding 500
square feet (46.45 m®) (see definition in Article 81). Plans shall be submitted with applications
for such permits in accordance with UFC Section 105.8 and Article 81.

Liquefied petroleum gases, store, use, handle, dispense (1.1)
See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 82.
1. To store, use, handle, or dispense LP-gas.

Lumber yards (1.3)
To store lumber in excess of 100,000 board feet (9290.3 m’* surface area of lumber
25.4 mm in thickness). See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 30.

Magnesium working (m.1)
To melt, cast, heat, treat, or grind more than 10 pounds (4.54 kg) of magnesium per
working day. See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 43.

Motor vehicle fuel-dispensing stations (m.3)

To dispense flammable or combustible liquids, liquefied petroleum gases, or
compressed natural gas at motor vehicle fuel-dispensing stations. See UFC Section 105.8 and
Article 52.

Organic coatings (0.2)
To manufacture more than 1 gallon (3.79 L) of organic coatings in a working day. See
UFC Section 105.8 and Article 50.



CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962 PAGE 9

Places of assembly (p.2)
To operate a place of assembly. See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 25.

Radioactive materials (r.1)

To store or handle at any installation more than 1 microcurie (37,000 becquerel) of
radioactive material not contained in a sealed source of more than 1 millicurie (37,000,000
becquerel) of radioactive material in a sealed source or sources, or any amount of radioactive
material for which a specific license from the Nuclear Regulatory Commission is required. See
UFC Section 105.8 and Article 80.

Refrigeration equipment; operate (r.2)
To operate a mechanical refrigeration unit or system regulated by UFC Section 105.8
and Article 63. :

Repair garages (r.3)
To use a structure as a place of business for servicing or repairing motor vehicles. See
UFC Section 105.8 and Article 29.

Spraying or dipping (s.1)
To conduct a spraying or dipping operation utilizing flammable or combustible liquids
or the application of combustible powders regulated by UFC Section 105.8 and Article 45.

Tire storage (t.2)
To use an open area or portion thereof to store tires in excess of 1,000 cubic feet (28.3
m’). See UFC Section 105.8 and Section 1103.3.6.

Wood products (w.1)
To store chips, hogged material, lumber, or plywood in excess of 200 cubic feet (5.67
m’). See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 30.

2. FEES FOR ACTIVITY PERMITS

The following activity permits within the categories set forth in UFC Section 105.8 are
subject to a permit fee of $60 each:

Bowling pin or alley refinishing (b.2)

To conduct a bowling pin refinishing or bowling alley resurfacing operation involving
the use and application of flammable liquids or materials. See UFC Section 105.8 and Article
26.

Candles and open flames in assembly areas (b.2)

To use open flames or candles in connection with assembly areas, dining areas of
restaurants or drinking establishments. For definition of ASSEMBLY, see UFC Section 105.8
and Article 2. See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 25 for open flame and candles.

O

Q



CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962 PAGE 10

Carnivals and fairs (c.2)
To conduct a carnival or fair. See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 25.

Explosives or blasting agents; use, dispose (e.1)
For permits for explosives or blasting agents, see UFC Section 105.8 and Article 77.

Fireworks; displays (f.2)
For permits for fireworks, see UFC Section 105.8 and Article 78.

Hot work operations (h.3)
Permits are required for hot work including, but not limited to, public exhibitions and

demonstrations where hot work is conducted.

Liquefied petroleum gases; install containers (1.1)
See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 82.
To maintain LP-gas containers.

Liquid- or gas-fueled vehicles or equipment in assembly buildings (1.2)
To display, compete, or demonstrate liquid- or gas-fueled vehicles or equipment in
assembly buildings. See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 25.

Mall, covered (m.2)

See UFC Section 105.8 and Article 35.

To use a covered mall in the following manner:
1. Placing or constructing temporary kiosks, display bootlis, concession

equipment or the like in the mall.

2. To use a mall as a place of assembly.
3. To use open-flame or flame-producing devices.
4 To display any liquid- or gas-fueled powered equipment.

Open burning (0.1)

To conduct open burning. Where burning is conducted on public property or the
property of someone other than the permit applicant, the permit applicant shall demonstrate
that permission has been obtained by the appropriate government agency, the owner, or the
owner’s authorized agent. When limits for atmospheric conditions or hours restrict burning,
such limits shall be designated in the permit restrictions. See UFC Section 105.8 and Section
1102.3.

Parade floats (p.1)
To use a parade float for public performance, presentation, spectacle, entertainment, or

parade. See UFC Section 105.8 and Section 1104.

Pyrotechnical special effects material (p.3)
For permits for pyrotechnical special effects material, see UFC Section 105.8 and

Article 78



CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962 PAGE 11

Temporary membrane structures, tents, and canopies (t.1) ﬁ
To erect or operate an air-supported temporary membrane structure or tent having an

area in excess of 200 square feet (18.6 m?), or a canopy in excess of 400 square feet (37.2

m?), except for structures used exclusively for camping. See UFC Section 105.8 and Article

32.

3. PERMIT FEES FOR INSTALLATION, REMOVAL, OR ALTERATION
The following activities regarding installation, removal, and alteration within the C\

categories set forth in UFC Section 105.8 as amended are subject to the permit fees set forth
below:

ACTIVITY FEE

Asbestos removal (a.4) Per 97 UBC § 107

Compressed gases, including medical gases* to install system(s) | Per 97 UBC § 107
(c.7)

Flammable or combustible liquids*; to remove, install, | Per 97 UBC § 107
construct, alter, underground or aboveground tank(s) (f.3)

Hazardous materials*; install, repair, or remove equipment or to | Per 97 UBC § 107
close or modify a storage facility (h.1)

Liquefied petroleum gases*; to install tank(s) (1.1) Per 97 UBC § 107 {\
Ovens, industrial baking or drying equipment (0.€) Per 97 UBC § 107 W
Refrigeration equipment*; installation (r.2) Per 97 UBC § 107
Spraying or dipping equipment* (s.1) Per 97 UBC § 107
Paint spraying booths (x-4) Per 97 UBC § 107
Fire extinguishing system(s) and equipment (x-1) Per 97 UBC § 107
Fire alarm system(s), equipment and monitoring (x-2) Per 97 UBC § 107
Smoke control system(s) and equipment Per 97 UBC § 107
Gates obstructing a fire apparatus access lane (g.1) Per 97 UBC § 107

Any other tank(s) or equipment regulated by 97 UFC § 105.8 Per 97 UBC § 107

o
4. ANNUAL HAZARDOUS MATERIALS STORAGE PERMIT FEE ’

The annual permit fee for hazardous material storage is $60 per quantity range, based
on quantities stored, manufactured, used in process, sold, transported, or otherwise utilized in
the form of liquids, solids, or gases. The quantity range is as determined by the Permit
Calculation Table below. This fee is in addition to and independent of the renewable permit Q\
fee for hazardous materials. 2



CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962

PERMIT CALCULATION TABLE

PAGE 12

QUANTITY RANGES

Liquids in Gallons

x 3.785 for L

Range

0
54
500
946
1,836
4,500
15,180
65,581
70,000
75,000
85,000

OO0 IRAUN A WN—O

Solids by Pounds

X 0.4536 for kg

Range

0
499
1,000
2,000
3,000
4,000
5,000
10,000
11,000
12,000
15,000

OV UNAEWN O

Gases by Cubic Feet

x 0.028 for m’

Range

0
199
1,000
3,600
6,800
16,400
35,000
54,000
74,000
80,000
90,000

500NN AWN=O




CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962

5. FEES REGARDING WATER MAIN/FIRE HYDRANT SYSTEMS

PAGE 13

The following fees are payable for the plan review and inspections of water main/fire

hydrant systems.

ITEM

FEE

Plan with existing hydrants

$60.00 permit and
plan review fee

Plan with new or relocated hydrant(s)

$60.00 permit and
plan review fee plus
$20.00 for each
new or relocated
fire hydrant

6. FEES REGARDING FIRE LANES

The following fees are payable for the plan review and inspections of fire lanes.

ITEM FEE
Existing plan with revisions $60.00 fee
New fire lane plan $60.00 permit fee
and $40.00 plan
review fee

7. FEES REGARDING COMMERCIAL NEW CONSTRUCTION

The following fees are payable for the plan review and inspections of commercial new

construction.

ITEM

FEE

Building Department permit and plan reviews for commercial new
construction

10 % surcharge fee
for work performed
by the Fire
Department




CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962

8. FEES REGARDING RECORDS, PHOTOGRAPHS, AND DOCUMENTS

PAGE 14

The following fees are payable for Fire Department records, photographs, and

documents. Fees may be waived in connection with items which have been subpoenaed.
ITEM FEE

Written records, including fire reports and investigation reports $1.00 per page
| Audio cassette tapes $15.00

Photographs: 4"x5" (101.6 mm x 127 mm) $2.00

Photographs: 8"x10” (203.2 mm x 254 mm) $11.00

Photographs: Enlargements $11.00

VCR tape $25.00

9. FEES FOR OTHER SERVICES

Other services provided by the Fire Prevention Division are subject to the fees set forth
below. For purposes of this Table, the Standard Hourly Fee (SHF) is $60.00.

SERVICE

FEE

Fire watch service (3-hour minimum)

SHF

Requested inspection outside of normal business hours.

SHF per inspector,
including travel
time, with a 3-hour
minimum

Lock box service No fee
Research, consultation, or testimony by any fire personnel in civil $120 per hour
proceedings requested

Additional inspections or reinspections for renewable permits, new
construction permits, fire protection systems due to system inspection
deficiencies, cancellations with less than four (4) hours notice, or
requiring additional inspections due to inspecting partial systems

SHF per inspector,
including travel time

Any inspection or reinspection requested during normal working hours if it
is found that the requesting party is not ready for the inspection

SFH per inspector,
including travel time

Plan reviews which are requested to be performed outside normal
business hours

SHF, with a 1-hour
minimum

Additional plan reviews either required or requested because of changes,
additions, or revisions to submitted or approved plans

SHF, with a 1-hour
minimum

Same day inspection (less than 24 hours’ notice)

$120 per inspector,
including travel time

File searches: Searches for requested information contained in files,
including “Environmental Assessments”

SHF, with a 1-hour
minimum

Fire flows: Searches for requested information contained in files related to
fire flows, and to assist in or witness fire flows

SHF per inspector,
with a 1-hour
minimum

Emergency apparatus or unit standby

$250 per hour, with
a 4-hour minimum




CITY OF HENDERSON
ORDINANCE NO. 1962 PAGE 15

10. TECHNOLOGY FEES

All permit and plan review fees listed in Sections | through VIl above shall be subject to
an additional 2% Technology Fee, minimum fee $2.00.

11. RECORDS MANAGEMENT FEE

All permit and plan review fees listed in Sections | through VIl above shall be subject to
an additional 2% Records Management Fee, minimum fee $2.00.



	Ordinance 1962
	Ordinance 1962 Part 15.32.050

